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Global Rescue closes the final link in providing medical 
evacuation service. They are the new gold standard 
by which all other services will be judged.  The key 
innovation behind Global Rescue is the company’s use 
of highly trained military people – Air Force Pararescue 
personnel, Navy Seals, Army Special Forces operatives, 
Marine Force Reconnaissance members - to plan and 
execute all of its evacuations. It is individuals of this 
caliber that Global Rescue has hired, put on retainer or 
simply put on standby.  

The military people Global Rescue has on call provide the 
company with the capability to react to an emergency 
anywhere in the world – from the middle of the ocean… 
to the Pamirs… to remote parts of Africa and South 
America. It was, in fact, a rescue that Global Rescue 
performed in South America recently that sealed my 
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decision to go with the firm. Seems a hiker in Colca 
Canyon, Peru, lost his footing earlier this year and 
tumbled down the side of the canyon in a very remote 
area. A MedJetAssist member, he called for assistance 
and was told he would be assisted only when he made 
his way to Lima – an impossibility in his condition.  At 
that point, a member of the hiking party called Global 
Rescue, who had a helicopter in the canyon the next 
morning.

What the founder, Daniel Richards, has done is change 
the whole conversation about services of this sort. He’s 
raised the bar to a level no one had conceived of before.

(For a copy of the entire article, please contact Global 
Rescue at 800-381-9754)


